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COURT FILE NUMBER: CV-24-00715326-00CL 
 
 

ONTARIO  
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

B E T W E E N: 

CONSTANTINE ENTERPRISES INC. 
 

APPLICANT 
- AND - 

 
SAM M (180 SAW) LP INC. AND 

SAM M (180 SAW) INC. 
 

RESPONDENTS 
 
 
 

IN THE MATTER OF AN APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE 
BANKRUPTCY AND INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, C. B-3, AS AMENDED, AND 

SECTION 101 OF THE COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.O. 1990, C. C.43, AS AMENDED 

THIRD REPORT OF  
KSV RESTRUCTURING INC. 

 AS RECEIVER AND MANAGER  
 

DECEMBER 10, 2024 

1.0 Introduction 

1. Pursuant to an order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (the “Court”) issued on 
June 4, 2024 (the “Receivership Order”), KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”) was 
appointed as the receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) of (i) all partnership interests 
in Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) LP (the “Partnership”) owned by Sam M (180 
SAW) LP Inc. (“Mizrahi Partner”); and (ii) all shares in the capital of Mizrahi 
Constantine (180 SAW) Inc. (the “General Partner”) owned by Sam M (180 SAW) 
Inc. (“Mizrahi Shareholder”, together with Mizrahi Partner, the “Debtors”), and in 
respect of both (i) and (ii), all dividends, distributions, and proceeds therefrom and 
substitutions therefor (collectively, the “Property”).  A copy of the Receivership Order 
is provided in Appendix “A”.  

2. The primary purpose of these receivership proceedings was to conduct a sale process 
for the Property (the “Sale Process”).  
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3. On June 21, 2024, the Court issued an endorsement and an order approving, among 
other things: 

a) the Sale Process, as set out in the Receiver’s First Report to Court dated 
June 14, 2024 (the “First Report”); and 

b) the agreement of purchase and sale dated June 14, 2024 between Constantine 
Enterprises Inc. (“CEI”) and the Receiver (the “Stalking Horse APS”) solely for 
the purpose of acting as the “stalking horse” in the Sale Process. 

4. In response to issues raised by Sam Mizrahi and the Debtors concerning aspects of 
the Sale Process, the Court’s approval of the Stalking Horse APS was subject to a 
right of Mr. Mizrahi and the Debtors to come back and make further submissions. In 
connection therewith, the Receiver drafted a supplement to the First Report dated 
July 8, 2024 (the “Supplement to the First Report”). On July 10, 2024, the parties 
made further submissions before the Court and Mr. Justice Black issued an 
endorsement regarding the concerns raised by Mr. Mizrahi and the Debtors. 

5. No offers were submitted by the bid deadline in the Sale Process and the Stalking 
Horse APS was deemed to be the successful bid.  

6. On September 20, 2024, the Court made an Order (the “Approval and Vesting 
Order”), among other things, approving the sale of the Property to CEI pursuant to 
the Stalking Horse APS (the “Transaction”).  A copy of the Approval and Vesting 
Order is provided in Appendix “B”.  

7. The Transaction closed on November 14, 2024. 

8. This report (the “Report”) is filed by KSV in its capacity as Receiver.   

1.1 Purposes of this Report 

1. The purposes of this Report are to: 

a) provide an overview of the Receiver’s activities since the Receiver’s second 
report to Court dated August 20, 2024 (the “Second Report”); 

b) recommend that the Receiver be discharged as Receiver upon filing a certificate 
with the Court confirming that all receivership matters have been completed (the 
“Discharge Certificate”); and 

c) recommend that the Court issue an order: 

i. approving this Report and the Receiver’s activities detailed herein and in 
the First Report, the Supplement to the First Report, the Second Report, 
and the Supplement to the Second Report of the Receiver dated 
September 13, 2024 (the “Supplement to the Second Report”); 

ii. approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its legal 
counsel, Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“Norton Rose”), for the 
period ending November 30, 2024; 
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iii. approving an accrual of $50,000 (the “Fee Accrual”) to cover the fees 
of the Receiver and Norton Rose incurred or expected to be incurred 
until the filing of the Discharge Certificate (including disbursements and 
HST); 

iv. authorizing the Receiver to distribute any surplus funds from the Fee 
Accrual to CEI; 

v. discharging the Receiver upon the filing of the Discharge Certificate; and 

vi. releasing the Receiver, upon the Receiver’s discharge, from any and all 
liability that KSV now has or may hereafter have by reason of, or in any 
way arising out of, the acts or omissions of KSV while acting as Receiver, 
save and except for its gross negligence or willful misconduct. 

1.2 Restrictions 

1. The Receiver has not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy or 
completeness of the Information in a manner that complies with Canadian Auditing 
Standards (“CAS”) pursuant to the Chartered Professional Accountants of Canada 
Handbook and, accordingly, the Receiver expresses no opinion or other form of 
assurance as contemplated under the CAS in respect of the Information.  Any party, 
other than the Court, wishing to place reliance on the Information should perform its 
own due diligence and the Receiver accepts no responsibility for any reliance placed 
on the Information in this Report by any party. 

2. Additional background information regarding the Debtors and the reasons for the 
appointment of the Receiver are provided in the affidavits of Robert Hiscox, a 
representative of CEI, sworn February 23, 2024 and April 16, 2024.  Copies of the 
Court materials filed in these proceedings are available on the Receiver’s case 
website at: https://www.ksvadvisory.com/experience/case/180SAW. 

1.3 Currency 

1. All currency references in this Report are in Canadian dollars. 

2.0 Background 

1. The Partnership is the owner of the real property located at 180 Steeles Avenue West, 
Vaughan, Ontario (the “180 Steeles Real Property”).  The 180 Steeles Real Property 
is planned to be a high-rise mixed-use development consisting of up to 2,196 
residential units across four towers (the “180 Steeles Project”).  The 180 Steeles 
Project is currently in the early stages of development, with zoning being pursued to 
convert the property to its proposed use from its current use, being a large retail plaza 
with over a dozen storefronts and a low-rise office building. 

2. An organizational chart showing the relationships among CEI, the Partnership, 
Mizrahi Partner and Mizrahi Shareholder, prior to the closing of the Transaction, is 
provided below: 
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3. As reflected above, prior to the closing of the Transaction, the limited partnership 
interests in the Partnership were held one-third by Mizrahi Partner and two-thirds by 
CEI. The shares in the capital of the General Partner were held 50% by Mizrahi 
Shareholder and 50% by CEI.   

4. Pursuant to the Receivership Order, the Receiver was appointed over: 

a) Mizrahi Partner’s interest in the Partnership; and  

b) Mizrahi Shareholder’s shares in the General Partner.   

5. The Receiver was not appointed over the Partnership’s assets and accordingly the 
Receivership Order does not extend to the 180 Steeles Real Property or the 180 
Steeles Project. 

6. Sam Mizrahi is the President of the General Partner and of 1000041090 Ontario Inc. 
(i.e. the “SPV”).  He is also the principal of the Mizrahi Development group of 
companies, a condominium development and building group.  Mr. Mizrahi was 
previously the President of Mizrahi Partner and Mizrahi Shareholder.  Based on a 
corporate profile report appended to the First Report, as of March 1, 2024, Amanda 
Brown is now the President of Mizrahi Partner and Mizrahi Shareholder.   

7. Mr. Mizrahi is the borrower under the 180 SAW Loan (as defined below), which is 
guaranteed by Mizrahi Partner and Mizrahi Shareholder.   
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3.0 Creditors 

3.1 Secured Creditors 

1. CEI is a secured creditor of the Debtors.  The table below provides a summary of the 
Debtors’ obligations owing to CEI as of November 13, 2024 (excluding interest 
accruing from and after November 13, 2024 and legal fees and disbursements 
incurred before and accruing after that date) prior to the closing of the Transaction, 
as provided by CEI. 

(Unaudited) Debtor $ 
    

180 SAW Loan Indebtedness (the “180 SAW Loan”) Mizrahi Partner 
Mizrahi Shareholder 

18,898,763 

180 SAW Note Indebtedness (the “180 SAW Note”) Mizrahi Partner 
Mizrahi Shareholder 

13,076,645 

SPV Indebtedness (the “SPV Loan”) Mizrahi Partner 2,475,179 
Default Loan Indebtedness (“Default Indebtedness”), 
which continued to accrue, with costs and with 
subsequent advances made 

Mizrahi Partner 2,284,011 

  36,734,598 

 
2. A discussion of the 180 SAW Loan, the 180 SAW Note, the SPV Loan and the Default 

Loan is provided in Section 3.1 of the First Report and is not repeated in this Report. 

3. As noted in the Second Report, Norton Rose provided the Receiver with opinions that, 
subject to standard assumptions and qualifications, the security outlined therein is 
valid and enforceable.   

4. CEI advanced $566,031 to the Receiver during the receivership proceedings, secured 
by the Receiver’s Borrowing Charge (as defined in the Receivership Order) (the 
“Interim Loans”).  Including accrued interest, the balance was $572,647 on 
November 13, 2024, immediately prior to the closing of the Transaction.  

4.0 Completion of the Transaction 

1. The Sale Process and Transaction were summarized in the Second Report and are 
not repeated herein.  As noted, the Transaction closed on November 14, 2024. 

2. The purchase price of $8 million was satisfied by way of credit bid, with the Purchase 
Price being applied against the CEI debt as set out in the Stalkng Horse APS and 
detailed below.  

 $ 
  

Interim Loans 572,647 
Default Indebtedness 2,284,011 
SPV Loan 2,475,178 
180 SAW Note 2,668,164 
 8,000,000 

 



ksv advisory inc. Page 6 

3. Following completion of the Transaction, the Debtors owe CEI the principal amount 
of $18,898,763 in respect of the 180 SAW Loan and $10,408,481 in respect of the 
180 SAW Note, in each case as of November 14, 2024, plus applicable interest 
accruing after that date and fees and expenses incurred before and accruing after 
that date.  

5.0 Receiver’s Discharge and Release 

1. Prior to completing its administration of the receivership, the Receiver intends to: 

a) pay any outstanding professional fees which are outstanding as of the date of 
this Report;  

b) prepare and file the Receiver’s final report as required under Section 246 of the 
Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act; and 

c) deal with any sundry issues not specified above. 

2. Once the Receiver has completed its activities, it will file the Discharge Certificate as 
its duties and responsibilities under the Receivership Order and other orders made in 
these proceedings will have been completed. 

3. The Receiver is of the view that the proposed release is appropriate in the 
circumstances.  The Receiver has faced opposition and allegations at various points 
in the receivership from the Debtors and Mr. Mizrahi. The granting of the release will 
permit the Receiver to complete its mandate including the return of any balance of the 
holdback.  In the Receiver’s view, its conduct and activities during the receivership 
have been consistent with its mandate under the Receivership Order and the other 
Orders issued in these proceedings. 

6.0 Receiver’s Activities 

1. The Receiver’s activities since the Second Report have included, inter alia, the 
following: 

a) corresponding with CEI, Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP (“Cassels”), CEI’s 
counsel, and Norton Rose regarding the Transaction and concerns raised by 
Sam Mizrahi and the Debtors concerning the Transaction; 

b) reviewing letters from Mr. Mizrahi’s counsel dated August 23 and September 4, 
2024;  

c) dealing with operational issues related to the Partnership (which owns retail 
properties at 180 Steeles Avenue West); 

d) preparing the Supplement to the Second Report, this Report and reviewing and 
commenting on the motion materials in respect of same; 

e) reviewing and commenting on the closing documents; 
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f) dealing with closing of the Transaction, and corresponding with CEI, Cassels 
and Norton Rose regarding same; and 

g) dealing with other matters pertaining to the administration of this mandate. 

7.0 Professional Fees 

1. The fees of the Receiver since the commencement of the receivership proceeding to 
November 30, 2024 total $126,936.38, excluding disbursements and HST.   

2. Norton Rose’s fees since the commencement of the receivership proceeding to 
November 30, 2024 total $112,459.25, excluding disbursements and HST.  

3. Fee affidavits and accompanying invoices in respect of the fees and disbursements 
of the Receiver and Norton Rose for these periods are attached as Appendices “C” 
and “D”, respectively. 

4. The average hourly rate for the Receiver for the referenced billing period was $673.01. 
The average hourly rate for Norton Rose was $760.12. 

5. The Receiver is requesting the Fee Accrual of $50,000 to cover its further fees and 
disbursements and those of Norton Rose incurred or to be incurred from and after 
December 1, 2024 until the filing of the Discharge Certificate.  

6. The Receiver is of the view that Norton Rose’s hourly rates are consistent with the 
rates charged by other law firms practicing in the area of insolvency in the Toronto 
market, and that its fees are reasonable and appropriate in the circumstances.  

7. The Receiver is also of the view that the Fee Accrual is reasonable and appropriate 
in the circumstances as it provides for the estimated fees incurred or to be incurred 
by the Receiver and Norton Rose prior to the filing of the Discharge Certificate. To the 
extent there is any surplus remaining from the Fee Accrual following the filing of the 
Discharge Certificate, the Receiver will distribute those funds to CEI as partial 
repayment of the remaining secured indebtedness owing to CEI.  

8.0 Receiver’s Discharge 

1. Based on the foregoing, the Receiver respectfully recommends that this Honourable 
Court make an order granting the relief recommended herein.  

 
*     *     * 

All of which is respectfully submitted, 
 
 
 
KSV RESTRUCTURING INC., 
SOLELY IN ITS CAPACITY AS RECEIVER AND MANAGER OF  
ALL PARTNERSHIP INTERESTS IN MIZRAHI 
CONSTANTINE (180 SAW) LP OWNED BY SAM M (180 SAW) LP INC. AND  
ALL SHARES IN THE CAPITAL OF MIZRAHI CONSTANTINE (180 SAW) INC.  
OWNED BY SAM M (180 SAW) INC. 
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COURT FILE NO.: CV-24-00715326-00CL 
 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 
 

BETWEEN: 
 

CONSTANTINE ENTERPRISES INC. 
 

APPLICANT 
- AND - 

 
SAM (180 SAW) LP INC. AND SAM M (180 SAW) INC. 

 
RESPONDENTS 

 

AFFIDAVIT OF ROBERT KOFMAN 
(Sworn December 10, 2024) 

I, Robert Kofman, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH AND 

SAY: 

1. I am the President of KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”). 

2. Pursuant to an Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (“Court”) 

made on June 4, 2024 (“Order”), KSV was appointed as receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) 

of (i) all partnership interests in Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) LP owned by Sam M (180 SAW) 

LP Inc.; and (ii) all shares in the capital of Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) Inc. owned by Sam M 

(180 SAW) Inc. (the “Debtors”). 

3. I have been involved in the management of this mandate since the proceedings 

commenced.  As such, I have knowledge of the matters to which I hereinafter depose. 

4. On December 10, 2024, the Receiver issued its Third Report to Court in which it outlined 

its activities with respect to the Debtors and provided information with respect to its fees.   



 

5. I hereby confirm that attached as Exhibit “A” hereto are true copies of the accounts of KSV 

for the periods indicated and confirm that these accounts accurately reflect the services provided 

by KSV with respect to the Debtors and the fees and disbursements claimed by it.      

6. Additionally, attached hereto as Exhibit “B” is a summary of additional information with 

respect to all members of KSV who have worked on this matter, including their hours and rates, 

and I hereby confirm that the list represents an accurate account of such information.  

7. I consider the accounts to be fair and reasonable considering the circumstances 

connected with this administration.  

8. I also confirm that the Receiver has not received, nor expects to receive, nor has the 

Receiver been promised any remuneration or consideration other than the amount claimed in the 

accounts. 

 

SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of 
Toronto, on December 10, 2024.   
 

  
Rajinder Kashyap, a Commissioner, etc., 
Province of Ontario, for KSV Restructuring Inc. 
Expires February 23, 2027 

  
                 Robert Kofman 

 



This is Exhibit “A” referred to in the 
Affidavit of Bobby Kofman sworn before 

me, this 10th day of December, 2024 
 
 
 

……………………………………………………………. 
Rajinder Kashyap, a Commissioner, etc., 
Province of Ontario, for KSV Restructuring Inc. 
Expires February 23, 2027 
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220 Bay Street, Suite 1300

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6262

F +1 416 932 6266

ksvadvisory.com

INVOICE

Re: Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc. (collectively the “Debtors”)

For professional services rendered to June 30, 2024 by KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”) in its
capacity as Court-appointed receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) of (i) all partnership interests
in Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) LP (the “Partnership”) owned by Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. (the
“Mizrahi Partner”); and (ii) all shares in the capital of Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) Inc. (the
“General Partner”) owned by Sam M (180 SAW) Inc. (the “Mizrahi Shareholder” and together with
the Mizrahi Partner, the “Debtors”), and in respect of both (i) and (ii), all dividends, distributions,
and proceeds therefrom and substitutions therefor (collectively, the “Property”) pursuant to an order
of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) issued on June 4, 2024 (the
“Receivership Order”), including:

General Matters

 corresponding extensively with Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“NRF”), the
Receiver’s counsel, Constantine Enterprises Inc. (“CEI”), the Debtors’ principal
secured creditor and Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP (“Cassels”), CEI’s counsel,
regarding all aspects of the receivership proceeding;

Court Matters

 reviewing CEI’s receivership application materials (the “Receivership Application”),
including:

o the application record dated February 23, 2024;

o the record dated April 16, 2024;

o factums dated April 26 and May 8, 2024;

Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and

Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.
c/o KSV Restructuring Inc.
220 Bay Street, Suite 1300
Toronto ON M5J 2W4
Canada

July 18, 2024

Invoice No: 3791
HST #: 818808768RT0001
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o CEI’s Aide Memoire; and

o the draft Receivership Order;

 reviewing materials, including statements of claim, filed by Sam Mizrahi, the
Debtors’ principal;

 attending several calls with NRF, Cassels and/or CEI regarding the potential
receivership proceedings, including on February 17, April 12, 18, 26, May 2, 5, 6, 7,
8 and 21, 2024;

 attending the receivership application on May 13, 2024;

 reviewing the endorsement issued by the Court on June 4, 2024;

 working with NRF and Cassels to prepare motion materials to approve a sale
process (the “Sale Process”);

 preparing the Receiver’s First Report to Court dated June 14, 2024 and
corresponding with NRF, Cassels and CEI regarding same;

 attending the motion to approve the Sale Process on June 21, 2024;

 reviewing the endorsement of the Court on June 21, 2024;

Information Requests

 requesting background information from CEI regarding the Partnership’s project at
180 Steeles Avenue West, Vaughan, Ontario (the “Real Property”);

 reviewing information provided by CEI including, the rent roll, leases, property tax
bills and information regarding the development status of the Real Property;

Creditors

 having NRF review CEI’s security over the Debtors’ business and assets and
reviewing NRF’s security opinion;

 corresponding with CEI and Cassels regarding the Trez Capital Limited Partnership
loan to the Partnership and the potential repayment of same;

 reviewing a statement of claim issued by Core Architects Inc. against the
Partnership and the General Partner, among other parties;

Sale Process

 working with CBRE Limited (“CBRE”) to list the Retail APS for sale and settling the
terms of the listing agreement with CBRE;

 attending numerous calls with CBRE to prepare for the Sale Process;

 corresponding extensively with CBRE, NRF, Cassels and CEI regarding the Sale
Process;
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 corresponding with CEI regarding the list of “acceptable bidders” pursuant to the
Sale Process and discussing the list with CBRE;

 reviewing and commenting on marketing materials prepared by CBRE, including a
teaser and confidential information memorandum;

 reviewing information uploaded to the Sale Process data room (the “Data Room”)
prepared by CBRE;

 preparing a confidentiality agreement which is required for interested parties to
access the Data Room and corresponding with CBRE and NRF regarding same;

 reviewing and commenting on the stalking horse agreement of purchase and sale
dated June 14, 2024 between the Receiver and CEI and corresponding with CEI,
Cassels and NRF regarding same;

 staying apprised of the Sale Process, including dealing with CBRE and CEI
regarding same;

 reviewing a marketing update prepared by CBRE;

Other

 preparing and sending a letter to Canadian Western Bank (“CWB”) to change the
signing authority on the Partnership’s bank accounts with CWB;

 dealing with Steehild Investments Limited to change the signing authority on the
Partnership’s bank accounts with TD Bank (“TD”) and dealing with TD re same;

 opening receivership bank accounts;

 arranging to obtain copies of all of the Debtors’ books and records;

 attending calls on June 14 and 26, 2024 with Canada Revenue Agency regarding
the Debtors’ HST and corporate tax returns;

 drafting and sending to all creditors the Notice and Statement of the Receiver
pursuant to sections 245(1) and 246(1) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act;

 maintaining the Receiver’s case website;

 convening internal meetings; and

 dealing with all other matters not otherwise referred to herein.

Total fees and disbursements per attached time summary $57,768.11

HST $ 7,509.85

Total due $65,277.96



Personnel Rate ($) Hours Amount  ($)

Bobby Kofman 850 49.94 42,436.25             
Jordan Wong 550 24.69 13,546.50             
Other Staff and administration 195-225 6.08 1,348.88               

Total fees 80.71       57,331.63             
Out-of-pocket disbursements (photocopies, postage, Ascend fees) 436.48                  
Total fees and disbursements 57,768.11             

KSV Restructuring Inc.
Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.

Time Summary
For the Period Ending June 30, 2024
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220 Bay Street, Suite 1300

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6262

F +1 416 932 6266

ksvadvisory.com

INVOICE

Re: Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc. (collectively the “Debtors”)

For professional services rendered during July 2024 by KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”) in its
capacity as Court-appointed receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) of (i) all partnership interests
in Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) LP (the “Partnership”) owned by Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. (the
“Mizrahi Partner”); and (ii) all shares in the capital of Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) Inc. (the
“General Partner”) owned by Sam M (180 SAW) Inc. (the “Mizrahi Shareholder” and together with
the Mizrahi Partner, the “Debtors”), and in respect of both (i) and (ii), all dividends, distributions,
and proceeds therefrom and substitutions therefor (collectively, the “Property”) pursuant to an order
of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) issued on June 4, 2024 (the
“Receivership Order”), including:

General Matters

 corresponding with Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“NRF”), the Receiver’s
counsel, Constantine Enterprises Inc. (“CEI”), the Debtors’ principal secured
creditor and Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP (“Cassels”), CEI’s counsel, regarding
the receivership proceeding, including the court-approved sale process (the “Sale
Process”);

Court Matters

 reviewing the factum of Sam Mizrahi and the Debtors (collectively, the “Mizrahi
Parties”) dated July 5, 2024 (the “Mizrahi Factum”) regarding the Mizrahi Parties’
objection to the Sale Process;

 attending calls and corresponding extensively with NRF and Cassels regarding the
Mizrahi Factum;

Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and

Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.
c/o KSV Restructuring Inc.
220 Bay Street, Suite 1300
Toronto ON M5J 2W4

August 12, 2024

Invoice No: 3833
HST #: 818808768RT0001
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 preparing the Receiver’s supplemental report dated July 8, 2024 in response to the
Mizrahi Factum;

 reviewing and commenting on the Receiver’s factum dated July 8, 2024;

 attending the motion virtually on July 9, 2024;

Creditors

 dealing with CEI and Cassels regarding the sale of the Partnership’s loan from Trez
Capital Limited Partnership (“Trez”) to CEI;

 reviewing the Trez sale agreement dated July 2, 2024;

Sale Process

 attending weekly update calls regarding the Sale Process with CEI and CBRE
Limited (“CBRE”), the listing agent retained by the Receiver for the sale of the
Debtors’ partnership interests;

 reviewing weekly Sale Process updates provided by CBRE;

 reviewing and responding to comments from interested parties participating in the
Sale Process on the Receiver’s form of confidentiality agreement and corresponding
with CBRE regarding same;

 corresponding with CBRE and CEI to allow new parties into the Sale Process; (i.e.
parties who were not “CEI Acceptable Bidders”, as that term is defined in the Sale
Process);

 reviewing information uploaded by CBRE to the virtual data room;

Other

 corresponding with TD Bank (“TD”), including calls on July 2, 3, 10, and 11, 2024,
and with CEI, to change the signing authorities on the Partnership’s TD bank
account;

 preparing funding requests to CEI;

 maintaining the Receiver’s case website;

 convening internal meetings; and

 dealing with all other matters not otherwise referred to herein.

Total fees and disbursements per attached time summary $14,835.00

HST $ 1,928.55

Total due $16,763.55



Personnel Rate ($) Hours Amount  ($)

Bobby Kofman 850 8.35 7,097.50             
Jordan Wong 550 6.50 3,575.00             
Tony Trifunovic 450 9.00 4,050.00             
Other Staff and administration 195-225 0.50 112.50                

Total fees 24.35       14,835.00           
Out-of-pocket disbursements -                     
Total fees and disbursements 14,835.00           

KSV Restructuring Inc.
Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.

Time Summary
For the Period Ending July 31, 2024



ksv advisory inc.

220 Bay Street, Suite 1300

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6262

F +1 416 932 6266

ksvadvisory.com

INVOICE

Re: Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc. (collectively the “Debtors”)

For professional services rendered during August 2024 by KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”) in its
capacity as Court-appointed receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) of (i) all partnership interests
in Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) LP owned by Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. (the “Mizrahi Partner”);
and (ii) all shares in the capital of Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) Inc. owned by Sam M (180 SAW)
Inc. (the “Mizrahi Shareholder” and together with the Mizrahi Partner, the “Debtors”), and in
respect of both (i) and (ii), all dividends, distributions, and proceeds therefrom and substitutions
therefor (collectively, the “Property”) pursuant to an order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice
(Commercial List) (the “Court”) issued on June 4, 2024 (the “Receivership Order”), including:

General Matters

 corresponding with Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“NRF”), the Receiver’s
counsel, Constantine Enterprises Inc. (“CEI”), the Debtors’ principal secured
creditor and Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP (“Cassels”), CEI’s counsel, regarding
the receivership proceeding, including the Court-approved sale process of the
Property (the “Sale Process”);

Sale Process

 attending calls on August 1 and 8, 2024 regarding the Sale Process with CEI and
CBRE Limited (“CBRE”), the listing agent for the Property;

 reviewing and commenting on CBRE’s report summarizing the results of the Sale
Process and discussing same with CBRE and CEI;

 corresponding with CBRE regarding feedback from potential purchasers;

 corresponding with CEI regarding the August 23 Letter (as defined below) and CEI’s
dealings with Hyundai Asset Management and Daewoo Engineering &
Construction;

Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and
Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.
c/o KSV Restructuring Inc.
220 Bay Street, Suite 1300
Toronto ON M5J 2W4

September 23, 2024

Invoice No: 3918
HST #: 818808768RT0001
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Court Matters

 preparing the Receiver’s second report dated August 20, 2024 (the “Second
Report”), and corresponding with NRF, Cassels and CEI regarding same;

 reviewing and commenting on the following motion materials:

o the notice of motion;

o the Receiver’s factum dated August 22, 2024;

o the Receiver's Aide Memoire dated August 28, 2024; and

o draft order;

 reviewing a letter dated August 23, 2024 from Morse Shannon LLP (“Morse
Shannon”), Sam Mizrahi’s counsel, regarding the Sale Process (the “August 23rd

Letter”) and reviewing emails from Morse Shannon regarding same;

 discussing the August 23rd Letter with NRF, CEI and Cassels, including calls on
August 26, 27, 28 and 30, 2024;

 reviewing motion materials opposing the sale of the Property to CEI and
corresponding with NRF and Cassels regarding the same;

 attending a case conference on August 29, 2024 regarding the motion to be heard
on August 30, 2024 and reviewing the endorsement of the Court dated August 29,
2024;

 attending the Court hearing on August 30, 2024;

 drafting the Receiver’s supplement to the Second Report and discussing same with
NRF;

Other

 corresponding with CEI regarding receivership funding issues and issuing a
receiver’s certificate in respect of same;

 maintaining the Receiver’s case website;

 convening internal meetings; and

 dealing with all other matters not otherwise referred to herein.

Total fees and disbursements per attached time summary $24,645.98

HST 3,203.98

Total due $27,849.96



Personnel Rate ($) Hours Amount  ($)

Bobby Kofman 850 14.75 12,537.50    
Jordan Wong 550 14.50 7,975.00      
Tony Trifunovic 450 7.00 3,150.00      
Other Staff and administration 195-225 4.50 982.50         

Total fees 40.75       24,645.00    
Out-of-pocket disbursements (postage) 0.98             
Total fees and disbursements 24,645.98    

KSV Restructuring Inc.
Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.

Time Summary
For the Month Ending August 31, 2024



ksv advisory inc.

220 Bay Street, Suite 1300

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6262

F +1 416 932 6266

ksvadvisory.com

INVOICE

Re: Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc. (collectively the “Debtors”)

For professional services rendered during September 2024 by KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”) in
its capacity as Court-appointed receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) of (i) all partnership interests
in Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) LP owned by Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. (the “Mizrahi Partner”);
and (ii) all shares in the capital of Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) Inc. owned by Sam M (180 SAW)
Inc. (the “Mizrahi Shareholder” and together with the Mizrahi Partner, the “Debtors”), and in
respect of both (i) and (ii), all dividends, distributions, and proceeds therefrom and substitutions
therefor (collectively, the “Property”) pursuant to an order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice
(Commercial List) (the “Court”) issued on June 4, 2024 (the “Receivership Order”), including:

General Matters

 corresponding with Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“NRF”), the Receiver’s
counsel, Constantine Enterprises Inc. (“CEI”), the Debtors’ principal secured
creditor and Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP (“Cassels”), CEI’s counsel, regarding
the receivership proceeding, including the transaction for the sale of the Property
(the “Transaction”);

The Transaction

 reviewing letters dated August 23, 2024 and September 4, 2024 from Morse
Shannon LLP (“Morse Shannon”), Sam Mizrahi’s counsel, regarding the sale
process and the Transaction (the “Morse Shannon Letters”);

 corresponding with CEI regarding its historical correspondence with Hyundai Asset
Management (“Hyundai”);

 reviewing email correspondence between CEI and Hyundai prior to the receivership
proceedings;

Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and
Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.
c/o KSV Restructuring Inc.
220 Bay Street, Suite 1300
Toronto ON M5J 2W4

October 11, 2024

Invoice No: 3965
HST #: 818808768RT0001
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 corresponding with NRF, CEI and/or Cassels regarding a response to the Morse
Shannon Letters, including attending calls on September 3, 5, and 10, 2024;

 reviewing draft letters of intent between Hyundai and CEI;

 reviewing and commenting on NRF’s letter dated September 13, 2024 to Morse
Shannon in response to Morse Shannon’s September 4 letter;

 attending a call with NRF and Morse Shannon on September 17, 2024 regarding
the September 20, 2024 motion;

 convening a call with NRF and Cassels on September 30, 2024 regarding closing
the Transaction;

Court Matters

 preparing the Receiver’s supplement to the second report to Court dated September
13, 2024 (the “Supplemental Report”), including convening calls on September 3,
6, and 10, 2024 with NRF, Cassels and/or CEI regarding same;

 attending the Court hearing virtually on September 20, 2024;

 reviewing the Court’s endorsement and approval and vesting order dated
September 20, 2024;

Other

 reviewing documents regarding the removal of Sam Mizrahi as director of Mizrahi
Constantine (180 SAW) Inc.;

 reviewing the draft third amendment to the credit agreement between Canadian
Western Bank and Mizrahi Constantine (180 Saw) LP;

 corresponding with CEI regarding receivership funding issues and issuing a
receiver’s certificate in respect of same;

 attending a call with the Canada Revenue Agency on September 13, 2024 regarding
HST filings;

 maintaining the Receiver’s case website;

 convening internal meetings; and

 dealing with all other matters not otherwise referred to herein.

Total fees and disbursements per attached time summary $18,563.75

HST 2,413.29

Total due $20,977.04



Personnel Rate ($) Hours Amount  ($)

Bobby Kofman 850 18.05          15,342.50    
Jordan Wong 550 4.75            2,612.50      
Other Staff and administration 195-225 2.75            608.75         

Total fees 25.55          18,563.75    

KSV Restructuring Inc.
Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.

Time Summary
For the Period Ending September 30, 2024



ksv advisory inc.

220 Bay Street, Suite 1300

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6262

F +1 416 932 6266

ksvadvisory.com

INVOICE

Re: Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc. (collectively the “Debtors”)

For professional services rendered during October 2024 by KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”) in its
capacity as Court-appointed receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) of (i) all partnership interests
in Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) LP owned by Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. (the “Mizrahi Partner”);
and (ii) all shares in the capital of Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) Inc. owned by Sam M (180 SAW)
Inc. (the “Mizrahi Shareholder” and together with the Mizrahi Partner, the “Debtors”), and in
respect of both (i) and (ii), all dividends, distributions, and proceeds therefrom and substitutions
therefor (collectively, the “Property”) pursuant to an order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice
(Commercial List) (the “Court”) issued on June 4, 2024 (the “Receivership Order”), including:

 corresponding with Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“NRF”), the Receiver’s
counsel, Constantine Enterprises Inc. (“CEI”), the Debtors’ principal secured
creditor and Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP (“Cassels”), CEI’s counsel, regarding
the receivership proceeding, including the transaction for the sale of the Property
(the “Transaction”);

 attending a call on October 7, 2024 with NRF regarding land transfer taxes
potentially payable on the Transaction;

 dealing with NRF, Cassels and CEI regarding the timing of the closing of the
Transaction;

 maintaining the Receiver’s case website;

 dealing with banking matters;

 convening internal meetings; and

 dealing with all other matters not otherwise referred to herein.

Total fees per attached time summary $2,817.50

HST $366.28

Total due $3,183.78

Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and
Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.
c/o KSV Restructuring Inc.
220 Bay Street, Suite 1300
Toronto ON M5J 2W4

November 7, 2024

Invoice No: 4018
HST #: 818808768RT0001



Personnel Rate ($) Hours Amount  ($)

Bobby Kofman 850 3.20 2,720.00      
Other Staff and administration 195 0.50 97.50           

Total fees 3.70            2,817.50      

KSV Restructuring Inc.
Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.

Time Summary
For the Period Ending October 31, 2024



 
 

ksv advisory inc. 
220 Bay Street, Suite 1300 
Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4 

T +1 416 932 6262 
F +1 416 932 6266 

 
ksvadvisory.com 

 

INVOICE 

 

 

Re: Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc. (collectively the “Debtors”) 
 
For professional services rendered during November 2024 by KSV Restructuring Inc. in its capacity 
as Court-appointed receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) of (i) all partnership interests in Mizrahi 
Constantine (180 SAW) LP owned by Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc.; and (ii) all shares in the capital 
of Mizrahi Constantine (180 SAW) Inc. owned by Sam M (180 SAW) Inc., and in respect of both (i) 
and (ii), all dividends, distributions, and proceeds therefrom and substitutions therefor (collectively, 
the “Property”) pursuant to an order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) 
issued on June 4, 2024, including: 

 corresponding with Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“NRF”), the Receiver’s 
counsel, Constantine Enterprises Inc. (“CEI”), the Debtors’ principal secured 
creditor and Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP (“Cassels”), CEI’s counsel, regarding 
the receivership proceeding, including the transaction for the sale of the Property 
(the “Transaction”);  

 dealing with NRF, Cassels and CEI regarding closing the Transaction; 

 reviewing CEI’s summary of advances under the receiver’s certificates and interest 
calculation regarding same;  

 reviewing closing documents and issuing the receiver’s certificate regarding the 
completion of the Transaction; 

 attending a call on November 21, 2024 with NRF regarding closing and the 
Receiver’s discharge; 

 maintaining the Receiver’s case website; 

 dealing with banking matters; 

Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and  
Sam M (180 SAW) Inc. 
c/o KSV Restructuring Inc. 
220 Bay Street, Suite 1300 
Toronto ON M5J 2W4 

December 4, 2024  

 Invoice No: 4069 
HST #: 818808768RT0001  
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 convening internal meetings; and 

 dealing with all other matters not otherwise referred to herein.  

Total fees per attached time summary   $8,743.50 

HST  $1,136.66

Total due   $9,880.16

 



Personnel Rate ($) Hours Amount  ($)

Bobby Kofman 850 5.75 4,887.50        
Jordan Wong 550 5.50 3,025.00        
Tony Trifunovic 450 1.50 675.00           
Other Staff and administration 195-225 0.80 156.00           

Total fees 13.55            8,743.50        
Out-of-pocket disbursements (postage) -                 
Total fees and disbursements 8,743.50        

KSV Restructuring Inc.
Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.

Time Summary
For the Month Ending November 30, 2024



This is Exhibit “B” referred to in the 
Affidavit of Bobby Kofman sworn before 

me, this 10th day of December, 2024 
 
 
 

……………………………………………………………. 
Rajinder Kashyap, a Commissioner, etc., 
Province of Ontario, for KSV Restructuring Inc. 
Expires February 23, 2027 

 



Time Summary
For the Period from June 4, 2024 to November 30, 2024

Personnel Title Hours
Billing Rate 
($ per hour) Amount ($)

Robert Kofman President and Managing Director 100.04                     850 85,021.25           
Jordan Wong Director 55.94                      550 30,734.00           
Tony Trifunovic Manager 17.50                      450 7,875.00             
Other staff and administrative 15.13                      550 3,306.13             
Total fees         188.61 126,936.38         

Average hourly rate 673.01$              

Sam M (180 SAW) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 SAW) Inc.



Appendix “D”



Court File No.: CV-24-00715326-00CL 

ONTARIO  
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

B E T W E E N: 

CONSTANTINE ENTERPRISES INC. 

Applicant 
- AND -

SAM M (180 SAW) LP INC. AND 
SAM M (180 SAW) INC. 

Respondents 

IN THE MATTER OF AN APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE 
BANKRUPTCY AND INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, C. B-3, AS AMENDED, AND 

SECTION 101 OF THE COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.O. 1990, C. C.43, AS AMENDED 

AFFIDAVIT OF JENNIFER STAM 
(Sworn December 7, 2024) 

I, Jennifer Stam, of the City of Toronto, MAKE OATH AND SAY: 

1. I am a barrister and solicitor qualified to practice law in the Province of Ontario and a

partner with Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“NRFC”), counsel to KSV Restructuring Inc. 

(“KSV”), in its capacity Court-appointed receiver (the “Receiver”) in these proceedings (the 

“Proceedings”),  and as such have knowledge of the matters herein deposed to. Where I have 

indicated that I have obtained facts from other sources, I believe those facts to be true.  

2. I make this affidavit in support of a motion by the Receiver for, among other things,

approval of the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel, NRFC. 

3. Attached hereto as Exhibit “A” is a schedule summarizing the accounts of NRFC

rendered to KSV for fees and disbursements incurred by NRFC from the date of NRFC's

engagement in connection with the Proceedings (the "Engagement") to November 30, 2024.
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4. Attached hereto as Exhibit “B” is a statement of experience summarizing the respective 

years of call and billing rates of each of the professionals at NRFC that rendered services to 

KSV, the hours worked by each such individual and a blended hourly rate for the file. 

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit “C” are true copies of the accounts rendered to KSV for the 

above-noted period. I confirm that these accounts accurately reflect the services provided by 

NRFC for this period and the fees and disbursements claimed by it for this period.  

6. To the best of my knowledge, the rates charged by NRFC from the Engagement to 

November 30, 2024 are comparable to the rates charged by other law firms in the Toronto 

market for the provision of similar services. I believe that the total hours, fees and 

disbursements incurred by NRFC on this matter are reasonable and appropriate in the 

circumstances.

SWORN by Jennifer Stam, before me at the 
City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, on 
December 7, 2024 in accordance with 
O. Reg. 431/20, Administering Oath or
Declaration Remotely.

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 
(or as may be) 

JENNIFER STAM 



THIS IS EXHIBIT “A” REFERRED TO IN THE 
AFFIDAVIT OF JENNIFER STAM, SWORN BEFORE ME 

AT THE CITY OF TORONTO, IN THE PROVINCE OF 
ONTARIO, ON  DECEMBER 7, 2024 IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH O. REG. 431/20, ADMINISTERING OATH OR 
DECLARATION REMOTELY. 

A Commissioner for taking Affidavits (or as may be) 
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SCHEDULE OF ACCOUNTS 

Account Date For Billing  
Period Ending 

Fees Costs Tax TOTAL 

April 05, 2024 March 31, 2024 $     36,829.50 $     199.80 $  4,806.53 $   41,835.83 

June 07, 2024 May 31, 2024 $      13,532.50 $     141.25 $  1,772.39 $   15,446.14 

July 08, 2024 June 30, 2024 $      20,926.50 $     389.60 $  2,724.94 $   24,041.04 

August 09, 2024 July 31, 2024 $ 6,239.50 $ 0.00 $ 811.14 $ 7,050.64 

September 13, 2024 August 31, 2024 $ 18,800.25 $ 0.00 $ 2,444.03 $ 21,244.28 

October 04, 2024 September 30, 2024 $ 6,841.50 $ 0.00 $ 889.40 $ 7,730.90 

November 12, 2024 October 31, 2024 $ 4,687.50 $ 0.00 $ 609.38 $ 5,296.88 

December 04, 2024 November 30, 2024 $ 4,602.00 $ 0.00 $ 598.26 $ 5,200.26 

TOTAL: $ 112,459.25 $ 730.65 $14,656.07 $ 127,845.97 

 



 

  

 

 

  

THIS IS EXHIBIT “B” REFERRED TO IN THE 
AFFIDAVIT OF JENNIFER STAM, SWORN BEFORE ME 

AT THE CITY OF TORONTO, IN THE PROVINCE OF 
ONTARIO, ON  DECEMBER 7, 2024 IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH O. REG. 431/20, ADMINISTERING OATH OR 
DECLARATION REMOTELY. 

A Commissioner for taking Affidavits (or as may be) 
 



STATEMENT OF EXPERIENCE 

Name Year of Call Billing Rate Hours Worked 

M. Kelly 1988 $  1,200.00 1.70 

A. Oliver 1993 $  1,350.00 0.80 

J. Stam 2002 $  975.00 85.40 

L. Archibald 2023 $   495.00 18.15 

K. Parent Law Clerk $  430.00 23.50 

D. St-Louis Law Clerk $  415.00 1.60 

M. Tsetsos Law Clerk $  400.00 3.50 

J. Pritchard Student-at-law $  370.00 13.30 

TOTAL HOURS: 147.95 

Blended Rate: 
(excl. Disbursements and HST) 

$112,459.25 ÷ 147.95 hours  = $ 760.12 



 

  

 

 

 

THIS IS EXHIBIT “C” REFERRED TO IN THE 
AFFIDAVIT OF JENNIFER STAM, SWORN BEFORE ME 

AT THE CITY OF TORONTO, IN THE PROVINCE OF 
ONTARIO, ON   DECEMBER 7, 2024 IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH O. REG. 431/20, ADMINISTERING OATH OR 
DECLARATION REMOTELY. 

A Commissioner for taking Affidavits (or as may be) 
 



For the attention of: Bobby Kofman,

President and Managing Director

bkofman@ksvadvisory.com

KSV Restructuring Inc. 
150 King Street West 
Suite 2308, Box 42 
Toronto ON  M5H 1J9

Invoice Number 9090650173

Matter Number 1001284922

Invoice Date April 05, 2024

NRF Contact Jennifer Stam

INVOICE

Payable Upon Receipt 
PAYMENT INFORMATION 

Beneficiary: Norton Rose Fulbright Canada S.E.N.C.R.L., s.r.l/ LLP 1, Place Ville Marie, suite 2500 Montreal Quebec, CANADA H3B 1R1 
Bank information: RBC Financial Group, 1 Place Ville Marie, Montreal, Quebec, CANADA H3C 3B5, Bank 003, Transit 00001, ACC. No. 161-327-2, Swift Code # 
ROYCCAT2. Include invoice number on transfer order. 

Please be alert to the risks of cyber-crime and email impersonation attempts to redirect funds inappropriately. We will not under usual circumstances change 
our bank account details during the course of a transaction. Any communication which you receive advising otherwise could be fraudulent and should urgently 
be orally verified with your known contact at our firm, or a member of our Finance department.  

Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP 
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53 
Toronto ON  M5K 1E7 
Canada

Tel: +1 416-216-4000

Fax: +1 416-216-3930

www.nortonrosefulbright.com

GST/HST No. 111340006

Accounts Contact:

nrcreceivables@nortonrosefulbright.com

180 SAW

Professional Services Rendered to March 31, 2024 Charges

CAD

SUMMARY

Taxable Fees 36,829.50

Taxable Disbursements 143.80

Taxable Amount 36,973.30

HST         13.000% 4,806.53

Non-Taxable Disbursements 56.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE CAD      41,835.83



Invoice Number 9090650173Invoice Date April 05, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

TIME DETAILS

DATE NAME HOURS DESCRIPTION

02/05/2024 Stam, J 0.80 Conference call with Cassels, KSV, J. Sprague regarding 
preliminary matters, security and other.  Internal discussions 
regarding and considering next steps.

02/06/2024 Stam, J 0.60 Preliminary work regarding security review and planning.  
Discussion with B. Kofman regarding same.  Internal 
discussions regarding same.

02/07/2024 Stam, J 2.10 Working on security review.

02/11/2024 Stam, J 1.70 Working on security review.

02/12/2024 Stam, J 5.80 Working on security review.

02/12/2024 Tsetsos, M 1.60 E-mail communications with J. Stam.  Receiving and 
reviewing PPSA searches and preparing search summary 
against various entities in Ontario.  Considering issue 
regarding PPSA registrations. Obtaining corporate profile 
reports and PPSA searches for J. Stam.

02/13/2024 Stam, J 7.30 Working on security review.  Discussion with Cassels 
regarding various matters.  Discussion regarding 
receivership matters.

02/14/2024 Stam, J 3.40 Working on security review.

02/15/2024 Pritchard, J 4.90 Reviewing the Limited Partnership Agreement and Hazelton 
Deficiency Agreement. Reviewing the documents that set 
out various security interests granted in favour of 
Constantine Enterprises Inc.  Revising the Opinions 
regarding such security interests.

02/15/2024 Stam, J 1.70 Working on security review and opinions.

02/16/2024 Tsetsos, M 0.80 E-mail communications with J. Stam.  Obtaining ON PPSA 
searches and preparing summary for Mizrahi Developments 
Inc.

02/17/2024 Stam, J 2.70 Reviewing draft court materials.  Discussion with B. Kofman 
regarding same.  Correspondence regarding same, revising 
security opinions.

02/18/2024 Stam, J 2.20 Working on security opinions.  Reviewing draft court 
materials.

02/18/2024 Pritchard, J 1.10 Revising Opinions regarding security interests.



Invoice Number 9090650173Invoice Date April 05, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

02/19/2024 Pritchard, J 4.10 Revising the Opinion regarding security interests granted in 
2021.

02/19/2024 St-Louis, D 0.10 Working session with J. Sprague regarding amendments to 
be made to the 2 opinions with regard to real estate matters.

02/19/2024 Stam, J 0.60 Further revision of opinions.  Correspondence regarding 
court materials.

02/20/2024 Pritchard, J 1.40 Reviewing and revising Opinion regarding security interests.

02/20/2024 St-Louis, D 1.50 Drafting the required real estate portions into the 2 draft 
Opinions. Reviewing title to the properties as required. 
Reviewing the registered instruments as required. Working 
session with J. Sprague. Attending telephone call with J. 
Pritchard. Further correspondence regarding the draft 
opinions and advising regarding changes to same.

02/21/2024 Stam, J 0.20 Review draft court materials.  Correspondence regarding 
opinions.

02/23/2024 Stam, J 0.10 Consider comments on security opinions.  Correspondence 
regarding same.

02/24/2024 Parent, K 0.10 Receipt of Application Record and brief review of same.

02/27/2024 Stam, J 0.70 Correspondence regarding security opinions.  Revising 
same.

02/29/2024 Kelly, M 1.30 Reviewing opinion.

03/11/2024 Stam, J 0.20 Reviewing aide memoires.

Total 47.00

TIME SUMMARY

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Partner

Kelly, M 1.30 1,200.00 1,560.00

Stam, J 30.10 975.00 29,347.50

Sub Total 30,907.50

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT



Invoice Number 9090650173Invoice Date April 05, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

Trainee

Pritchard, J 11.50 370.00 4,255.00

Sub Total 4,255.00

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Paralegal

Parent, K 0.10 430.00 43.00

St-Louis, D 1.60 415.00 664.00

Tsetsos, M 2.40 400.00 960.00

Sub Total 1,667.00

Total 47.00 36,829.50

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY

DESCRIPTION QTY AMOUNT

Montreal

Non-Taxable

Registration Fee 1.00               56.00

Taxable

Registration Fee 1.00              143.80

Sub Total              199.80

TOTAL 199.80



For the attention of: Bobby Kofman,

President and Managing Director

bkofman@ksvadvisory.com

KSV Restructuring Inc. 
150 King Street West 
Suite 2308, Box 42 
Toronto ON  M5H 1J9

Invoice Number 9090667688

Matter Number 1001284922

Invoice Date June 07, 2024

NRF Contact Jennifer Stam

INVOICE

Payable Upon Receipt 
PAYMENT INFORMATION 
  
Beneficiary: Norton Rose Fulbright Canada S.E.N.C.R.L., s.r.l/ LLP 1, Place Ville Marie, suite 2500 Montreal Quebec, CANADA H3B 1R1 
Bank information: RBC Financial Group, 1 Place Ville Marie, Montreal, Quebec, CANADA H3C 3B5, Bank 003, Transit 00001, ACC. No. 161-327-2, Swift Code # 
ROYCCAT2. Include invoice number on transfer order. 
  
Please be alert to the risks of cyber-crime and email impersonation attempts to redirect funds inappropriately. We will not under usual circumstances change 
our bank account details during the course of a transaction. Any communication which you receive advising otherwise could be fraudulent and should urgently 
be orally verified with your known contact at our firm, or a member of our Finance department.  

Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP 
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53 
Toronto ON  M5K 1E7 
Canada

Tel: +1 416-216-4000

Fax: +1 416-216-3930

www.nortonrosefulbright.com

GST/HST No. 111340006

Accounts Contact:

nrcreceivables@nortonrosefulbright.com

180 SAW

Professional Services Rendered to May 31, 2024 Charges

CAD

SUMMARY

Taxable Fees 13,532.50

Taxable Disbursements 101.25

Taxable Amount 13,633.75

HST         13.000% 1,772.39

Non-Taxable Disbursements 40.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE CAD      15,446.14
  



Invoice Number 9090667688Invoice Date June 07, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

TIME DETAILS

DATE NAME HOURS DESCRIPTION

04/18/2024 Stam, J 0.30 Discussion with J. Dietrich and B. Kofman regarding next 
steps.

04/24/2024 Stam, J 0.40 Reviewing responding materials.

05/06/2024 Stam, J 0.20 Discussion regarding stalking horse and sale process. 
Correspondence regarding same.

05/07/2024 Stam, J 0.40 Discussion with J. Bornstein regarding stalking horse and 
SISP matters. Correspondence with B. Kofman regarding 
same. Considering same. Reviewing draft documents 
regarding receivership.

05/09/2024 Parent, K 0.30 Receipt of reply materials and organizing application 
hearing documents.

05/09/2024 Pritchard, J 0.50 Reviewing documentation regarding perfection of security 
interests.

05/09/2024 Stam, J 1.80 Review of stalking horse agreement. Working on SISP. 
Discussion with J. Wong regarding same.

05/09/2024 Tsetsos, M 0.50 E-mail communications with J. Pritchard.  Conducting 
corporate and PPSA searches against various entities. 
Receiving, Reviewing and preparing summary against 
various entities.  Forwarding same to J. Pritchard.

05/10/2024 Parent, K 1.00 Preparing draft notice of motion and draft SISP approval 
order.

05/10/2024 Pritchard, J 1.30 Reviewing updated corporate profile and PPSA searches. 
Revising the security interest opinion to reflect any changes. 
Corresponding with J. Stam regarding revisions to the 
opinion.

05/12/2024 Stam, J 2.60 Reviewing draft report. Correspondence regarding same. 
Comments on stalking horse APA.

05/13/2024 Stam, J 3.70 Attending Receivership Application. several discussions 
regarding same. Revising draft report. Correspondence 
regarding same.

05/13/2024 Tsetsos, M 0.30 E-mail communications with J. Pritchard.  Obtaining, 
receiving and forwarding corporate profile against Mizrahi 
Constantine (180 Saw) Inc. to J. Pritchard.

05/14/2024 Parent, K 1.50 Continuing to draft notice of motion and draft SISP approval 
order. Preparing factum shell for same.



Invoice Number 9090667688Invoice Date June 07, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

05/14/2024 Stam, J 0.60 Reviewing and Revising draft report. Correspondence with 
Cassels regarding same.

05/21/2024 Stam, J 0.40 Conference call regarding stalking horse and SISP 
processes.

05/22/2024 Stam, J 0.30 Discussion regarding opinion issues. Correspondence 
regarding same.

05/23/2024 Kelly, M 0.40 Considering issue of  and 
sending note to R. Wahl.

05/28/2024 Parent, K 1.00 Reviewing updated report and updating motion materials.

Total 17.50

TIME SUMMARY

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Partner

Kelly, M 0.40 1,200.00 480.00

Stam, J 10.70 975.00 10,432.50

Sub Total 10,912.50

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Trainee

Pritchard, J 1.80 370.00 666.00

Sub Total 666.00

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Paralegal

Parent, K 3.80 430.00 1,634.00

Tsetsos, M 0.80 400.00 320.00

Sub Total 1,954.00

Total 17.50 13,532.50



Invoice Number 9090667688Invoice Date June 07, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY

DESCRIPTION QTY AMOUNT

Montreal

Non-Taxable

Registration Fee 1.00               40.00

Taxable

Registration Fee 1.00              101.25

Sub Total              141.25

TOTAL 141.25



For the attention of: Bobby Kofman,

President and Managing Director

bkofman@ksvadvisory.com

KSV Restructuring Inc. 
150 King Street West 
Suite 2308, Box 42 
Toronto ON  M5H 1J9

Invoice Number 9090676512

Matter Number 1001284922

Invoice Date July 08, 2024

NRF Contact Jennifer Stam

INVOICE

Payable Upon Receipt 
PAYMENT INFORMATION 
  
Beneficiary: Norton Rose Fulbright Canada S.E.N.C.R.L., s.r.l/ LLP 1, Place Ville Marie, suite 2500 Montreal Quebec, CANADA H3B 1R1 
Bank information: RBC Financial Group, 1 Place Ville Marie, Montreal, Quebec, CANADA H3C 3B5, Bank 003, Transit 00001, ACC. No. 161-327-2, Swift Code # 
ROYCCAT2. Include invoice number on transfer order. 
  
Please be alert to the risks of cyber-crime and email impersonation attempts to redirect funds inappropriately. We will not under usual circumstances change 
our bank account details during the course of a transaction. Any communication which you receive advising otherwise could be fraudulent and should urgently 
be orally verified with your known contact at our firm, or a member of our Finance department.  

Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP 
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53 
Toronto ON  M5K 1E7 
Canada

Tel: +1 416-216-4000

Fax: +1 416-216-3930

www.nortonrosefulbright.com

GST/HST No. 111340006

Accounts Contact:

nrcreceivables@nortonrosefulbright.com

180 SAW

Professional Services Rendered to June 30, 2024 Charges

CAD

SUMMARY

Taxable Fees 20,926.50

Taxable Disbursements 34.60

Taxable Amount 20,961.10

HST         13.000% 2,724.94

Non-Taxable Disbursements 355.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE CAD      24,041.04
  



Invoice Number 9090676512Invoice Date July 08, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

TIME DETAILS

DATE NAME HOURS DESCRIPTION

06/02/2024 Stam, J 0.50 Revising revised stalking horse agreement, form of bid and 
draft report. Correspondence regarding same.

06/04/2024 Stam, J 0.30 Reviewing endorsement and order. Preliminary discussions 
regarding next steps.

06/05/2024 Parent, K 0.20 Correspondence with Court regarding availability for sale 
hearing. Preparing request form for same.

06/06/2024 Parent, K 0.20 Attending to scheduling June 21 hearing with Court. 
Confirming same.

06/06/2024 Stam, J 0.70 Reviewing listing agreement. Comments regarding same. 
Discussions regarding SISP and stalking horse. 
Correspondence regarding same.

06/07/2024 Stam, J 0.90 Discussion regarding security opinion regarding default loan 
obligations. Correspondence regarding same. Reviewing 
listing agreement regarding SAW.

06/08/2024 Stam, J 0.80 Reviewing revised CBRE agreement. Drafting funding side 
letter. Reviewing draft communications to Steehild. 
Correspondence regarding same.

06/09/2024 Stam, J 1.80 Reviewing draft report and APS. Drafting court materials 
regarding same. Correspondence regarding same.

06/10/2024 Stam, J 0.40 Working on court materials. Correspondence regarding 
same.

06/10/2024 Tsetsos, M 0.30 E-mail communications with J. Stam.  Obtaining corporate 
profile reports and forwarding same to J. Stam.

06/11/2024 Parent, K 0.60 Updating motion materials with recently received comments. 
Preparing motion record.

06/11/2024 Stam, J 0.70 Working on court materials. Finalizing opinions.

06/12/2024 Parent, K 0.30 Receipt of review of updated service list.  Preparing motion 
materials.

06/12/2024 Stam, J 1.30 Working on court materials, stalking horse APA and other 
documents for June 21 motion. Conversations and 
correspondence regarding same.

06/13/2024 Stam, J 1.60 Working on motions. Several discussions regarding same.

06/13/2024 Parent, K 0.60 Preparing motion materials for sale approval motion.

06/14/2024 Parent, K 2.70 Updating Notice of Motion and draft Order.  Preparing and 



Invoice Number 9090676512Invoice Date July 08, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

Finalizing Motion Record.  Attending to service and filing of 
Motion Record. Hyperlinking and uploading to CaseLines.  
Correspondence with J. Stam regarding materials.

06/14/2024 Stam, J 1.20 Finalizing court materials for service. Conversations and 
correspondence regarding same.

06/15/2024 Stam, J 2.20 Drafting factum regarding sale process and SH motion. 
Correspondence regarding same.

06/16/2024 Stam, J 0.30 Revising factum. Correspondence regarding same.

06/17/2024 Parent, K 2.40 Reviewing factum and updating footnotes, citations and 
schedules. Reviewing, revising and Finalizing factum for 
service. Attending to service of same.

06/17/2024 Stam, J 0.90 Conference call with CEI, KSV, Cassels regarding various. 
Finalizing factum. Correspondence regarding various.

06/19/2024 Stam, J 0.40 Considering correspondence regarding SAW from S. Weisz. 
Working on other matters.

06/20/2024 Parent, K 0.50 Preparing updated draft order and participant information 
form for June 21 hearing.  Correspondence regarding 
additional attendees and updating participant form to reflect 
same.

06/20/2024 Stam, J 1.40 Addressing matters regarding June 21 motion. 
correspondence with Cozen O'Connor regarding same. 
Discussions with B. Kofman and others regarding same. 
Preparing for same.

06/21/2024 Stam, J 1.90 Preparing for and attending motion regarding sale process 
approval. Follow-up conversations and correspondence 
regarding same

06/24/2024 Parent, K 0.10 Submitting Order for entering with Court.

06/26/2024 Parent, K 0.20 Circulating order and endorsement to service list.

06/28/2024 Stam, J 0.60 Reviewing Trez amendment. Considering same. 
Correspondence regarding same.

Total 26.00

TIME SUMMARY

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Partner



Invoice Number 9090676512Invoice Date July 08, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

Stam, J 17.90 975.00 17,452.50

Sub Total 17,452.50

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Paralegal

Parent, K 7.80 430.00 3,354.00

Tsetsos, M 0.30 400.00 120.00

Sub Total 3,474.00

Total 26.00 20,926.50

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY

DESCRIPTION QTY AMOUNT

Montreal

Non-Taxable

Court Fee 1.00              339.00

Registration Fee 1.00               16.00

Taxable

Registration Fee 1.00               34.60

Sub Total              389.60

TOTAL 389.60



For the attention of: Bobby Kofman,

President and Managing Director

bkofman@ksvadvisory.com

KSV Restructuring Inc. 
150 King Street West 
Suite 2308, Box 42 
Toronto ON  M5H 1J9

Invoice Number 9090685378

Matter Number 1001284922

Invoice Date August 09, 2024

NRF Contact Jennifer Stam

INVOICE

Payable Upon Receipt 
PAYMENT INFORMATION 
  
Beneficiary: Norton Rose Fulbright Canada S.E.N.C.R.L., s.r.l/ LLP 1, Place Ville Marie, suite 2500 Montreal Quebec, CANADA H3B 1R1 
Bank information: RBC Financial Group, 1 Place Ville Marie, Montreal, Quebec, CANADA H3C 3B5, Bank 003, Transit 00001, ACC. No. 161-327-2, Swift Code # 
ROYCCAT2. Include invoice number on transfer order. 
  
Please be alert to the risks of cyber-crime and email impersonation attempts to redirect funds inappropriately. We will not under usual circumstances change 
our bank account details during the course of a transaction. Any communication which you receive advising otherwise could be fraudulent and should urgently 
be orally verified with your known contact at our firm, or a member of our Finance department.  

Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP 
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53 
Toronto ON  M5K 1E7 
Canada

Tel: +1 416-216-4000

Fax: +1 416-216-3930

www.nortonrosefulbright.com

GST/HST No. 111340006

Accounts Contact:

nrcreceivables@nortonrosefulbright.com

180 SAW

Professional Services Rendered to July 31, 2024 Charges

CAD

SUMMARY

Taxable Fees 6,239.50

Taxable Amount 6,239.50

HST         13.000% 811.14

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE CAD      7,050.64
  



Invoice Number 9090685378Invoice Date August 09, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

TIME DETAILS

DATE NAME HOURS DESCRIPTION

07/01/2024 Stam, J 0.30 Working on Trez interest sheet. Correspondence regarding 
same.

07/03/2024 Stam, J 0.20 Correspondence with S. Weisz regarding comeback. 
Considering same.

07/05/2024 Stam, J 0.80 Reviewing reply factum from Cozen. Research regarding 
same. Correspondence regarding same.

07/06/2024 Stam, J 1.60 Conference call regarding reply factum. Working on same. 
Discussions regarding same. Reviewing supplemental 
report.

07/07/2024 Parent, K 1.70 Updating and finalizing reply factum and footnotes/citations. 
Preparing supplemental motion record and finalizing same.

07/07/2024 Stam, J 0.30 Revising responding factum. Comments on supplemental 
report. Correspondence regarding same.

07/08/2024 Parent, K 1.20 Attending to service of Reply Factum and Supplemental 
Motion Record on Service List.  Preparing affidavit of 
service.  Attendance to filing of same.  Hyperlinking and 
uploading same to CaseLines.  Preparing participant 
information form for July 9 hearing. Correspondence with 
parties regarding same.

07/09/2024 Parent, K 0.20 Finalizing and uploading participant form to CaseLines.

07/09/2024 Stam, J 1.70 Preparing for and attending comeback hearing

07/11/2024 Parent, K 0.10 Preparing draft service email to service list attaching 
endorsement dated July 8, 2024.

07/23/2024 Parent, K 0.20 Updating service list and circulating same for posting on 
case website.

Total 8.30

TIME SUMMARY

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Partner

Stam, J 4.90 975.00 4,777.50



Invoice Number 9090685378Invoice Date August 09, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

Sub Total 4,777.50

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Paralegal

Parent, K 3.40 430.00 1,462.00

Sub Total 1,462.00

Total 8.30 6,239.50



For the attention of: Bobby Kofman,

President and Managing Director

bkofman@ksvadvisory.com

KSV Restructuring Inc. 
150 King Street West 
Suite 2308, Box 42 
Toronto ON  M5H 1J9

Invoice Number 9090695005

Matter Number 1001284922

Invoice Date September 13, 2024

NRF Contact Jennifer Stam

INVOICE

Payable Upon Receipt 
PAYMENT INFORMATION 
  
Beneficiary: Norton Rose Fulbright Canada S.E.N.C.R.L., s.r.l/ LLP 1, Place Ville Marie, suite 2500 Montreal Quebec, CANADA H3B 1R1 
Bank information: RBC Financial Group, 1 Place Ville Marie, Montreal, Quebec, CANADA H3C 3B5, Bank 003, Transit 00001, ACC. No. 161-327-2, Swift Code # 
ROYCCAT2. Include invoice number on transfer order. 
  
Please be alert to the risks of cyber-crime and email impersonation attempts to redirect funds inappropriately. We will not under usual circumstances change 
our bank account details during the course of a transaction. Any communication which you receive advising otherwise could be fraudulent and should urgently 
be orally verified with your known contact at our firm, or a member of our Finance department.  

Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP 
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53 
Toronto ON  M5K 1E7 
Canada

Tel: +1 416-216-4000

Fax: +1 416-216-3930

www.nortonrosefulbright.com

GST/HST No. 111340006

Accounts Contact:

nrcreceivables@nortonrosefulbright.com

180 SAW

Professional Services Rendered to August 31, 2024 Charges

CAD

SUMMARY

Taxable Fees 18,800.25

Taxable Amount 18,800.25

HST         13.000% 2,444.03

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE CAD      21,244.28
  



Invoice Number 9090695005Invoice Date September 13, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

TIME DETAILS

DATE NAME HOURS DESCRIPTION

08/01/2024 Parent, K 0.20 Updating service list and circulating same for posting.

08/04/2024 Stam, J 0.60 Considering issue regarding  
  Correspondence regarding same.

08/13/2024 Archibald, L 2.20 Attending a meeting to discuss the motion materials for 
Hazelton. Drafting a Request Form for the Receivership of 
Sam M (180 saw) LP Inc. and Sam M (180 saw) Inc. 
Drafting the Notice of Motion for the SAW motion.

08/13/2024 Stam, J 0.90 Attending to matters regarding sale approval.  
Correspondence regarding same.

08/14/2024 Parent, K 0.40 Preparing Notice of Motion shell for L. Archibald.  
Correspondence regarding same.

08/14/2024 Stam, J 0.40 Correspondence regarding August 30 motion.

08/15/2024 Archibald, L 0.55 Reviewing and revising draft SAW Approval and Vesting 
Order. Corresponding with J. Stam regarding the same.

08/15/2024 Stam, J 0.30 Discussion regarding August 30 hearing and scheduling 
matters. Discussion with J. Dietrich regarding same.

08/16/2024 Archibald, L 2.20 Reviewing and revising the draft Approval and Vesting 
Order from Cassels. Drafting the Notice of Motion for the 
August 30th hearing. Reviewing and revising the draft Court 
request form, and drafting a cover email regarding the 
request form. Corresponding with J.Stam and K.Parent 
regarding the same.

08/16/2024 Parent, K 1.00 Preparing correspondence to Court regarding motion 
scheduling. Preparing motion materials.  Preparing Factum 
shell.

08/17/2024 Archibald, L 1.70 Drafting the Factum for the August 30th hearing.

08/17/2024 Stam, J 1.30 Working on Court materials.  Discussion with B. Kofman 
regarding same. Correspondence regarding same.

08/19/2024 Parent, K 1.50 Updating Factum footnotes.  Finalizing Motion Record 
Indices with updated Exhibits. Preparing service materials.  
Meeting and correspondence with L. Archibald regarding 
materials and service.

08/19/2024 Archibald, L 1.20 Working on Motion materials.  Correspondence regarding 
same.

08/20/2024 Archibald, L 2.40 Reviewing, revising and finalizing all of the motion 



Invoice Number 9090695005Invoice Date September 13, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

materials . Reviewing and revising the Factums. Reviewing 
the Appendices in the AVOs for currency. Corresponding 
with our internal team regarding the next steps to take in 
respect to finalizing the motion materials.

08/20/2024 Parent, K 2.60 Continued work on motion materials and Factum.  
Reviewing and updating Appendices.  Revising and 
finalizing Motion Record. Attending to service of same.  
Discussions with J. Stam and L. Archibald regarding same.  
Preparing email to Court regarding submitting motion 
record.

08/20/2024 Stam, J 1.30 Finalizing Court materials for service.  Conversations and 
correspondence regarding same.

08/21/2024 Archibald, L 1.00 Conducting updated case law research for the Factums, 
and corresponding with J. Stam regarding the same.

08/21/2024 Parent, K 1.80 Preparing and swearing Affidavit of Service.  Attending to 
filing of Motion Record.  Email to Court regarding Case 
Center bundle. Discussions with L. Archibald.  Updating 
Factum footnotes.  Meeting with J. Stam and L. Archibald 
regarding status. Updating service list and circulating same.

08/23/2024 Stam, J 0.30 Discussions regarding motion and scheduling issues.  
Considering same.

08/27/2024 Archibald, L 0.60 Drafting the SAW and Hazelton aide memoires. Reviewing 
and revising the aide memoires to incorporate J.Stam's 
comments.

08/27/2024 Stam, J 0.60 Working on aide memoire.  Correspondence regarding 
scheduling and August 30 motion.

08/28/2024 Archibald, L 1.10 Drafting, reviewing and revising the aide memoires to 
incorporate J.Stam's comments. Drafting the service emails 
in respect to the aide memoires. Incorporating J.Stam's 
comments into the service emails and serving the aide 
memoires. Drafting the Affidavit of Service, and coordinating 
the commissioning of it. Completing the Attendance 
Request Form. Filing documents on Ontario Service and 
CaseLines.

08/28/2024 Stam, J 1.70 Finalizing and serving aide memoire.  Discussions and 
correspondence regarding August 29 appearance. 
Reviewing responding material regarding same.

08/29/2024 Stam, J 1.30 Preparing for and attending 9:30 scheduling appearance.  
Discussion with J. Bornstein, J. Arbuck, B. Kofman 
regarding same.  Follow up correspondence regarding 
same.



Invoice Number 9090695005Invoice Date September 13, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

08/30/2024 Stam, J 0.70 Conference call regarding next steps and other receivership 
matters. Considering same.

Total 29.85

TIME SUMMARY

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Partner

Stam, J 9.40 975.00 9,165.00

Sub Total 9,165.00

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Associate

Archibald, L 12.95 495.00 6,410.25

Sub Total 6,410.25

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Paralegal

Parent, K 7.50 430.00 3,225.00

Sub Total 3,225.00

Total 29.85 18,800.25



For the attention of: Bobby Kofman,

President and Managing Director

bkofman@ksvadvisory.com

KSV Restructuring Inc. 
150 King Street West 
Suite 2308, Box 42 
Toronto ON  M5H 1J9

Invoice Number 9090701293

Matter Number 1001284922

Invoice Date October 04, 2024

NRF Contact Jennifer Stam

INVOICE

  

Payable Upon Receipt 
PAYMENT INFORMATION 
  
Beneficiary: Norton Rose Fulbright Canada S.E.N.C.R.L., s.r.l/ LLP 1, Place Ville Marie, suite 2500 Montreal Quebec, CANADA H3B 1R1 
Bank information: RBC Financial Group, 1 Place Ville Marie, Montreal, Quebec, CANADA H3C 3B5, Bank 003, Transit 00001, ACC. No. 161-327-2, Swift Code # 
ROYCCAT2. Include invoice number on transfer order. 
  
Please be alert to the risks of cyber-crime and email impersonation attempts to redirect funds inappropriately. We will not under usual circumstances change 
our bank account details during the course of a transaction. Any communication which you receive advising otherwise could be fraudulent and should urgently 
be orally verified with your known contact at our firm, or a member of our Finance department.

Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP 
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53 
Toronto ON  M5K 1E7 
Canada

Tel: +1 416-216-4000

Fax: +1 416-216-3930

www.nortonrosefulbright.com

GST/HST No. 111340006

Accounts Contact:

nrcreceivables@nortonrosefulbright.com

180 SAW

Professional Services Rendered to September 30, 2024 Charges

CAD

SUMMARY

Taxable Fees 6,841.50

Taxable Amount 6,841.50

HST         13.000% 889.40

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE CAD      7,730.90
  



Invoice Number 9090701293Invoice Date October 04, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

TIME DETAILS

DATE NAME HOURS DESCRIPTION

09/02/2024 Archibald, L 0.10 Updating the service list. Corresponding with J.Stam and J.
Wong regarding same.

09/09/2024 Stam, J 0.70 Reviewing corporate governance amendments; considering 
same; correspondence regarding same.

09/11/2024 Stam, J 0.90 Reviewing corporate governance documents; reviewing 
SAW Credit Amendment; considering same; 
correspondence regarding same; reviewing further 
supplement.

09/13/2024 Parent, K 0.30 Preparing Affidavit of Service and swearing same.

09/13/2024 Parent, K 0.60 Preparing Second Supplement to Second Report and 
attendance to service of same.

09/16/2024 Archibald, L 1.90 Corresponding with the Court regarding the CaseLines 
bundle. Reviewing and updating the materials for the 
September 20 hearing, including adding hyperlinks to the 
Factum.

09/16/2024 Stam, J 0.40 Discussion with B. Kofman regarding governance matters; 
considering same.

09/19/2024 Archibald, L 0.20 Attending to matters in relation to the September 20th 
hearing.

09/19/2024 Stam, J 1.10 Preparing for September 20 motion.

09/20/2024 Stam, J 0.70 Preparing for and attending Court hearing; follow up 
discussions with J. Bornstein regarding same; considering 
next steps and outstanding issues.

09/25/2024 Stam, J 0.90 Reviewing draft closing documents; closing agenda.

09/30/2024 Archibald, L 0.40 Reviewing and revising the draft closing agenda and 
ancillary documents for the transaction.

09/30/2024 Stam, J 0.60 Reviewing closing documents; correspondence regarding 
same.

Total 8.80

TIME SUMMARY



Invoice Number 9090701293Invoice Date October 04, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Partner

Stam, J 5.30 975.00 5,167.50

Sub Total 5,167.50

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Associate

Archibald, L 2.60 495.00 1,287.00

Sub Total 1,287.00

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Paralegal

Parent, K 0.90 430.00 387.00

Sub Total 387.00

Total 8.80 6,841.50



For the attention of: Bobby Kofman,

President and Managing Director

bkofman@ksvadvisory.com

KSV Restructuring Inc. 
150 King Street West 
Suite 2308, Box 42 
Toronto ON  M5H 1J9

Invoice Number 9090711509

Matter Number 1001284922

Invoice Date November 12, 2024

NRF Contact Jennifer Stam

INVOICE

Payable Upon Receipt 
PAYMENT INFORMATION 
  
Beneficiary: Norton Rose Fulbright Canada S.E.N.C.R.L., s.r.l/ LLP 1, Place Ville Marie, suite 2500 Montreal Quebec, CANADA H3B 1R1 
Bank information: RBC Financial Group, 1 Place Ville Marie, Montreal, Quebec, CANADA H3C 3B5, Bank 003, Transit 00001, ACC. No. 161-327-2, Swift Code # 
ROYCCAT2. Include invoice number on transfer order. 
  
Please be alert to the risks of cyber-crime and email impersonation attempts to redirect funds inappropriately. We will not under usual circumstances change 
our bank account details during the course of a transaction. Any communication which you receive advising otherwise could be fraudulent and should urgently 
be orally verified with your known contact at our firm, or a member of our Finance department.  

Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP 
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53 
Toronto ON  M5K 1E7 
Canada

Tel: +1 416-216-4000

Fax: +1 416-216-3930

www.nortonrosefulbright.com

GST/HST No. 111340006

Accounts Contact:

nrcreceivables@nortonrosefulbright.com

180 SAW

Professional Services Rendered to October 31, 2024 Charges

CAD

SUMMARY

Taxable Fees 4,687.50

Taxable Amount 4,687.50

HST         13.000% 609.38

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE CAD      5,296.88
  



Invoice Number 9090711509Invoice Date November 12, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

TIME DETAILS

DATE NAME HOURS DESCRIPTION

10/01/2024 Stam, J 1.10 Considering issues regarding closing; discussion with B. 
Kofman regarding same; correspondence with J. Bornstein 
regarding same.

10/05/2024 Oliver, A 0.80 Review of corporate chart and considering LTT question.  
Email correspondence with J Stam.

10/06/2024 Stam, J 0.70 Discussion with B. Kofman, J. Wong regarding various 
issues; assessing land transfer tax issues; correspondence 
regarding same.

10/06/2024 Stam, J 0.70 Discussion with B. Kofman, J. Wong regarding various 
issues; assessing land transfer tax issues; correspondence 
regarding same.

10/30/2024 Stam, J 1.20 Considering 180 SAW claims; analysis regarding same; 
correspondence regarding same; drafting email regarding 
same.

Total 4.50

TIME SUMMARY

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Partner

Oliver, A 0.80 1,350.00 1,080.00

Stam, J 3.70 975.00 3,607.50

Total 4.50 4,687.50



For the attention of: Bobby Kofman,

President and Managing Director

bkofman@ksvadvisory.com

KSV Restructuring Inc. 
150 King Street West 
Suite 2308, Box 42 
Toronto ON  M5H 1J9

Invoice Number 9090718846

Matter Number 1001284922

Invoice Date December 04, 2024

NRF Contact Jennifer Stam

INVOICE

Payable Upon Receipt 
PAYMENT INFORMATION 
  
Beneficiary: Norton Rose Fulbright Canada S.E.N.C.R.L., s.r.l/ LLP 1, Place Ville Marie, suite 2500 Montreal Quebec, CANADA H3B 1R1 
Bank information: RBC Financial Group, 1 Place Ville Marie, Montreal, Quebec, CANADA H3C 3B5, Bank 003, Transit 00001, ACC. No. 161-327-2, Swift Code # 
ROYCCAT2. Include invoice number on transfer order. 
  
Please be alert to the risks of cyber-crime and email impersonation attempts to redirect funds inappropriately. We will not under usual circumstances change 
our bank account details during the course of a transaction. Any communication which you receive advising otherwise could be fraudulent and should urgently 
be orally verified with your known contact at our firm, or a member of our Finance department.  

Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP 
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53 
Toronto ON  M5K 1E7 
Canada

Tel: +1 416-216-4000

Fax: +1 416-216-3930

www.nortonrosefulbright.com

GST/HST No. 111340006

Accounts Contact:

nrcreceivables@nortonrosefulbright.com

180 SAW

Professional Services Rendered to November 30, 2024 Charges

CAD

SUMMARY

Taxable Fees 4,602.00

Taxable Amount 4,602.00

HST         13.000% 598.26

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE CAD      5,200.26
  



Invoice Number 9090718846Invoice Date December 04, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

TIME DETAILS

DATE NAME HOURS DESCRIPTION

11/12/2024 Stam, J 1.30 Correspondence regarding SAW closing and related 
documents; discussion with B. Kofman regarding same; 
reviewing closing documents.

11/13/2024 Archibald, L 0.50 Revising the SAW closing documents and attending to 
related closing matters.

11/13/2024 Stam, J 1.00 Attending to matters regarding closing; correspondence 
regarding same.

11/14/2024 Archibald, L 0.30 Attending to closing matters.

11/14/2024 Stam, J 0.40 Correspondence regarding closing; discussion with J. 
Bornstein regarding land transfer tax and post closing 
matters.

11/15/2024 Archibald, L 0.40 Attending to matters related to scheduling the discharge 
motion.

11/15/2024 Stam, J 0.40 Correspondence regarding discharge and other matters.

11/18/2024 Archibald, L 0.20 Attending to matters related to the closing documents.

11/21/2024 Stam, J 0.30 Correspondence regarding discharge motion.

11/26/2024 Archibald, L 0.30 Attending to matters regarding scheduling the Receiver's 
discharge motion.

11/27/2024 Archibald, L 0.40 Attending to matters regarding scheduling the Receiver's 
discharge motion.

11/28/2024 Archibald, L 0.50 Speaking with J. Stam about the next steps to take in 
respect to the discharge motion. Drafting the discharge 
order.

Total 6.00

TIME SUMMARY

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Partner

Stam, J 3.40 975.00 3,315.00



Invoice Number 9090718846Invoice Date December 04, 2024

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright.  Such fees and disbursements of member firms other than Norton Rose 
Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm. 
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose 
Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of them are members of Norton Rose 
Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself provide legal services to clients. For more information, see 
nortonrosefulbright.com.

Matter Number 1001284922

Matter Description 180 SAW

Sub Total 3,315.00

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Associate

Archibald, L 2.60 495.00 1,287.00

Sub Total 1,287.00

Total 6.00 4,602.00



CONSTANTINE ENTERPRISES INC. 

Applicant 

-and- SAM M (180 SAW) LP INC. AND 
SAM M (180 SAW) INC. 

 Respondents 

Court File No.:  CV-24-00715326-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

Proceeding commenced at Toronto 

AFFIDAVIT OF JENNIFER STAM
(Sworn December 7, 2024) 

NORTON ROSE FULBRIGHT CANADA LLP 
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53 
Toronto, ON  M5K 1E7   

Jennifer Stam LSO#: 46735J 
Tel: 416.202.6707 
jennifer.stam@nortonrosefulbright.com 

Lauren Archibald LSO#: 87151U 
Tel: 416.278.3787 
lauren.archibald@nortonrosefulbright.com 

Lawyers for the Receiver 
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